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Prof. Sabine Hahn (PhD, CNS, RN) heads the School of Nursing and the Unit of 
Applied Research in Nursing at Bern University of Applied Sciences. She started her 
as psychiatric nurse, working from 1985 till 1999 in direct care. She reached her 
Master of Science in Health and Nursing in 2003 at University of Maastricht (NL), 
changed then as lecturer and junior researcher to the field of higher education and 
works science 2005 at Bern University of Applied Sciences. In 2012 Sabine 
successfully defend her PhD-Theses at University of Maastricht. Sabine has broad 
competences and a profound expertise in management and leadership, in curriculum 
development for higher education, in strategy development and in the promotion of 
young talents. She is experienced as project manager of national and international 
research projects, in teaching at university level from bachelor to doctorate level and 
she is a pioneer of service user involvement. In addition to her profound research 
work, her focus was on building up highly educated and innovative academic staff. 
She conducts research in the areas of violence, de-escalation, and reduction of 
coercion in health care, in the area of staff retention as well as staff development in 
health care and quality development in nursing. Sabine Hahn is a visiting professor at 
the University of Bournemouth (UK) and co-leads the European Doctoral Program for 
Nursing and Health Science at Maastricht University, Bern University of Applied 
Sciences and the Medical University of Graz. She is board member of the European 
Violence in Psychiatric Research Group, Fellow of the European Association of 
Nursing Researchers, Sigma Teta Tau Member, SBK Member and Member of the 
Board of Directors of the Spitex Bern and Logisplus AG. She is also head of the 
scientific board of the Concret AG and the Psychiatric Service of Graubünden. She is 
editor of one scientific and one professional journal and scientific organizer of nursing 
conferences. 
For full CV and publication list see https://www.bfh.ch/de/ueber-die-
bfh/personen/sha5ommtuezx/ or Orchid https://orcid.org/0000-0002-2697-2014  
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